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English: We will begin our English learning 

with a short unit of poetry looking at Haikus 
and Cinquains, analysing poetry and using 
imagery including onomatopoeia to engage 
the senses of the reader. We will then move 
on to persuasive writing through 
advertisements looking at the use of 
superlatives, slogans and rhetorical 
questions, before finally looking at first 
person diary entries.  
 
In guided reading we will be looking at works 
by Dick King-Smith and Nizrana Farook as well 
as a non-fiction text to coincide with Black 
History month. 

Maths: We will be revisiting our place 

value learning from previous years and 
extending our understanding. 
 
In year 3 we will be looking at representing 
and partitioning numbers to 100 and 1000, 
using and estimating on a number line to 100 
and 1000, comparing and ordering numbers 
to 100 and 1000 and counting in 50s. 
 
In year 4 we will be looking at numbers up to 
10,000, partitioning them, estimating on a 
number line and 10, 100 or 1000 more or 
less, rounding numbers to the nearest 10, 100 
or 1000, ordering numbers up to 10,000 and 
Roman numerals. 

Science: Our science this term will be 

looking at rocks and how different types of 
rock are formed. We will learn about fossils 
and how soil is formed of rocks and other 
matter. In the second of half of term we will 
be learning about animals including humans, 
looking into the human digestive system and 
the different types and roles of our teeth.  
 

RE:.We will be looking at Christianity and 

how and why churches are different, learning 
about the various parts of the church building 
and their significance to Christians.  We will 
also be asking what moral guidance sacred 
texts provide. 

PSHE: We will be following the 

Cambridgeshire PSHE curriculum module 
entitled Myself and my relationships – Family 
and Friendship. We will be learning about the 
types of relationships we have within our 
friendship groups and family. 

PE/Games: One lesson of PE each week 

will be taught by the sports coach.  This term 
Mr Kirby will be teaching football and hockey. 
Mrs Clutton will be teaching ball skills and 
dance. Our PE days will be Thursday and 
Friday 

Computing: We will be revisiting our 

online safety learning before moving on to 
spreadsheets, graphing and simulations. 

French: In French we will learn how to get 

to know someone by learning how to greet 
them and ask basic questions. We will then 
learn how to tell someone about ourselves. 

Music: We will explore the instruments, 

stylistic features and rhythms of Bhangra 
music, developing our knowledge and 
understanding of standard notation through 
performing and notating rhythms using 
crotchets, paired quavers and crotchet rests. 
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Art/DT: In art we will be drawing still life 

pictures, using the work of Morandi as 
inspiration, focusing on lines and detail and 
using a viewfinder to select a focal point. We 
will then move on to painting comparing the 

work of two abstract artists examining in 
detail a part of a flower using magnifiers and 
viewfinders before sketching and then 
enlarging it.  In DT we will be looking at the 
difference between processed foods and 
fresh food making healthy pizza, fresh bread 
and soup. We will then move on to look at 
mechanisms including hinges to answer the 
question “how many ways are there to open 
a door?” 

History/Geography: In history we will 

be learning about the Stone Age, Bronze Age 
and Iron Age finding out about culture, 
lifestyle, technology, travel and religion. 
 
In geography we will be exploring human and 
physical features of Benwick and using the 
compass and maps to navigate around an 
area.  We will also be comparing, using an OS 
map, different areas of the country. 

Enrichment this term: 
 Share and shine 

 Remembrance Day 

 Anti-bullying week 

 Children In Need Day 

 Christmas Panto 

 Carols & Readings (parents invited) 
 
 

 


